510-RICR-00-00-1
TITLE510-BUILDING CODE COMMISSION

CHAPTER 00 — N/A

SUBCHAPTER 00 - N/A

PART 1 — RISBC-1 Rhode Island Building Code

1.1

Authority

The Rhode Island Building Code is promulgated by Fthe Building Code
Standards Committee—n-acecordance-with-the-rulemaking pursuant to the

authorlty granted in ef-R.1. Gen Laws 88 23 27.3-100.1.5 and 23-27.3- 109 1. —23-

Incorporated Materials

The Building Code Standards Committee hereby adopts and incorporates as the
Rhode Island Building Code the provisions of the International Building Code
(IBC), 2021 edition, as published by the International Code Council, Inc. (ICC)
not including any further editions or amendments thereof and only to the extent
that the provisions therein are not inconsistent with R.Il. Gen. Laws Chapter 23-
27.3 and any provisions reserved, deleted, or amended in this Regulation.

Page 1 of 94



Fhe-nternational-Buiding-Code,2018IBC 2021 Edition; is protected by
the copyright that has been issued to the ICC. IBC 2021 can be viewed

and purchased here: https://codes.iccsafe.org/codes/i-codes/2021-icodes.

To properly utilize the Rhode Island Building Code, IBC 2021 must be

read jointly with the Building Code requirements in R.l. Gen. Laws Chapter
23-27.3 and the amendments to IBC 2021 set forth in the sections of this
Regulation, below.

Format: These code changes follow numbering sequence and topics of

the IBC 2021 (first printing). All provisions of IBC 2021 are retained unless
indicated as deleted or amended. Published errata are available from the
ICC website.

1.3 IBC2021is Adopted with the Following Amendments

Chapter 1: Administration

Chapter 1 is adopted with the following changes:

101.1 Delete IBC sections 101.1 Title-101-2-Scope-and-101-21-Appendices and

substitute the following:
101.1 Title

This Regulation shall be known as SBC-1-2021-the Rhode Island State
Building Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

101.2 Delete IBC section 101.2 and substitute the following:

101.2 Scope

The provisions of this code shall apply to the construction, alteration,
movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every
building or structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such
buildings or structures.

Exceptions:

1. Detached one (1) and two_(2) family dwellings and multiple single-
family dwellings (town houses) not more than three (3) stories

Page 2 of 94


https://codes.iccsafe.org/codes/i-codes/2021-icodes

above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and
their accessory structures shall comply with the SBG-2-2021,Fhe
Rhode Island One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code, Part 2 of this

Subchapter.

2. Existing buildings undergoing repair, alterations or additions and
changes of occupancy shall comply with the provisions the Rhode
Island Existing Building Code (Part 7 of this Subchapter) efthis

coede-or the State Rehabilitation Code-SRC-1-2002, Part 20 of this
Subchapter (see-R.l. Gen. Laws 8§ 23-27.3-106.0).

101.4 Delete IBC sections 101.4, and-101.4.1, 101.4.2, 101.4.3, 101.4.4,
101.4.5,1.1.4.6, and -through-101.4.7, -Referenced-Codes-in-its-entirety

and substitute the following:

101.4 Referenced Codes.

The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.711 below and
referenced elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of the
requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference.

Building Code. The provisions of the Rhode Island State Building Code,
this Part, shall apply wherever referenced in this code as the International
Building Code.

Residential Code. The provisions of the Rhode Island State One- and
Two-Family Dwelling Code, Part 2 of this Subchapter, shall apply
wherever referenced in this code as the International Residential Code.

Plumbing Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island State Plumbing Code,

Part 3 of this Subchapter, shall apply wherever referenced in this code as
the International Plumbing Code.

Mechanical Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island State Mechanical
Code, Part 4 of this Subchapter, shall apply wherever referenced in this
code as the International Mechanical Code.

Electrical Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island State Electrical Code,

Part 5 of this Subchapter, shall apply wherever referenced in this code as
the International Electrical Code.

Page 3 of 94


https://rules.sos.ri.gov/regulations/part/510-00-00-20

Property Maintenance Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island Property
Maintenance Code, Part 6 of this Subchapter, shall apply wherever
referenced in this code as the International Property Maintenance Code.

Energy Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island State Energy Code,
Part 8 of this Subchapter, shall apply wherever referenced in this code as
the International Energy Conservation Code.

Swimming Pool and Spa Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island State
Swimming Pool and Spa Code, Part 14 of this Subchapter, shall apply
wherever referenced in this code as the International Swimming Pool and

Spa Code.

Fuel Gas Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island State Fuel Gas Code,
Part 19 of this Subchapter, shall apply wherever referenced in this code as
the International Fuel Gas Code.

Fire Safety Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island Fire Safety Code
(450-RICR-00-00-1 through 10) shall apply wherever referenced in this
code as the International Fire Code.

Existing Building Code: The provisions of the Rhode Island Existing
Building Code (Part 7 of this Subchapter) or Rhode Island State
Rehabilitation Code (Part 20 of this Subchapter), shall apply wherever
referenced in this code as the International Existing Building Code.

Page 4 of 94



Page 5 of 94



103 Delete IBC sections 103 without substitution. :

103;

104.1 te-through 104.8, Delete IBC sections 104.1 through 104.8 without
substitution.-

105.3, 105.3.1, 105.3.2, and 105.5, Delete IBC sections 105.3, 105.3.1, 105.3.2,
and 105.5 without substitution. -

107.1, 107.3.1, 107.3.2, 107.3.4, and 107.3.4.1, Delete IBC sections 107.1,
107.3.1, 107.3.2, 107.3.4, and 107.3.4.1 without substitution.

108.2 Delete IBC section 108.2 without substitution.

111.4 Delete IBC section 111.4 without substitution.

113.1, 113.2, and 113.3, Delete IBC sections 113.1, 113.2, and 113.3 without
substitution. -

114.1, 114.2, and 114.3, Delete IBC sections 114.1, 114.2, and 114.3 without
substitution.

115.1, 115.2, and 115.3, Delete IBC sections 115.1, 115.2, and 115.3 without
substitution.

116.1, 116.2, 116.3, 116.4, and 116.5, Delete IBC sections 116.1, 116.2, 116.3,
116.4, and 116.5 without substitution. -

All other aAdministrative provisions of IBC 2021 shall remain in effect. To the
extent that there is an apparent conflict between the provisions of these
administrative sections and R.l. Gen. Laws Chapter 23-27.3, the provisions of
State law shall prevail. Where-otherprovisions-of-this-codereferto-provisions—of
appropriate:

Page 6 of 94



+-4—Chapter 2: Definitions
Chapter 2 is adopted with no changes. Add-the-following—definitions:

1+.5—Chapter 3: Use and Occupancy Classification

Chapter 3 is adopted with no changes.

Page 7 of 94



Page 8 of 94



Page 9 of 94



Page 10 of 94



Page 11 of 94



Chapter 4: Special Detailed Requirements Based on Occupancy and
Use

Chapter 4 is adopted with the following changes.

429 Add the following new section: IBC-section429 Manufactured Homes

4292 Manufactured Homes.

Manufactured homes are constructed in accordance with the Federal
Department of Housing and Urban Development Part 3280 Manufactured
Home Construction and Safety Standards. Refer to Appendix E of SBC2-
2021 the Rhode Island One and Two-Family Dwelling Code (Part 2 of this
Subchapter) for specific provisions regarding permitting, foundation
systems, additions, site utility connections and foundation and anchorage
details.

Page 12 of 94


https://rules.sos.ri.gov/regulations/part/510-00-00-2

430 Add the following new section: IBC-section430-Meodular Construction

4302 Modular Construction.

Buildings and structures partially or completely constructed off-site shall
be constructed in conformance with this code or SBE-2-2021-the Rhode
Island Residential One and Two-Family Code (Part 2 of this Subchapter)
as appropriate for the use and occupancy. Inspection, verification, and
approval shall be conducted in accordance with procedures issued by the

State Bqulnq Code Commlssmner M&nu#aetu#e#s—shaJHae—#eg&eﬁed

Chapter 5: General Building Heights and Areas

Chapter 5 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 6: Types of Construction

Chapter 6 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 7: Fire and Smoke Protections Features

Chapter 7 is adopted with no changes.

17— Chapter?
Resenved

Chapter 8: Interior Finishes

Chapter 8 is adopted with no changes.

1.8—Chapter 9: Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems

Chapter 9 is adopted with the following changes.

Page 13 of 94


https://rules.sos.ri.gov/regulations/part/510-00-00-2

Delete IBC section 906 in its entirety (including 906.1 through 906.10) and

substitute the following:
IBC-section-906 _ Portable Fire Extinguishers

9061 General
Page 14 of 94



Portable Fire Extinguishers shall be provided in accordance with the
Rhode Island Uniferm-State Fire Safety Code.

907 Delete IBC section 907 in its entirety (including 907.1 through 907.8) and

substitute the following:

IBC-section-907 __ Fire Alarm and Detection Systems
9071 General

FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS shall be provided in
accordance with the Rhode Island Uniferm-Eire CodeState Fire Safety
Code.

915 Delete section 915 in its entirety (including 915.1 through 915.6) and
substitute the following:

Section 915 Carbon Monoxide Detection

9151 FIRE-ALARM-AND-CARBON MONOXIDE DETECTION SY¥STEMS
shall be provided in accordance with the Rhode Island Yniferm-Fire
CodeState Fire Safety Code.

1-9—Chapter 10: Means of Egress

Chapter 10 is adopted with no changes.

1+-10-Chapter 11: Accessibility

Chapter 11 is adopted with no changes.
ldl the._follow lofinit . 1
CHILDREN:
) ) . . " .
I o | adults for 4 i I ).g|aele Al-other

Page 15 of 94




Page 16 of 94



Page 17 of 94



Page 18 of 94



Chapter 12: Interior Environment

Chapter 12 is adopted with no changes.

1131 -Chapter 13: Energy Efficiency

Chapter 13 is adopted with no changes.

112 Chapter 14: Exterior Walls

Chapter 14 is adopted with no changes.

Page 19 of 94



Page 20 of 94



1+13-Chapter 15: Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures

Chapter 15 is adopted with no changes.

1+-14-Chapter 16: Structural Design

Chapter 16 is adopted with the following changes. Belete IBC-section1608-1 General

Page 21 of 94



1608.2 Delete all Tables and Figures in IBC section 1608.2 "Ground Snow
Loads" and substitute the Table below in 8§ 1.4 of this Part.

1609.3 Delete all Tables and Figures in IBC section 1609.3 "
Basic design wind speed" and substitute the Table below in § 1.4 of this
Part.

Page 22 of 94



e Wind L\ (rrph
Risk Risk
Category | Category | Category
H
From-fig | Fromdig
1609.3(4) | 1609:3(1) | 160932
117 127
118 128
WBI1M/B
111 121
114 124
XWB1
121 131
WB1
116 126
WBIMN/B
e 126

Page 23 of 94




Page 24 of 94



Page 25 of 94




=

Page 26 of 94




Page 27 of 94




Page 28 of 94




Woonsocket 40 30 112 122 130/135
XAWBL XMNB2
WBIMWB
1
: . | ind
Blue_ color-by-model-code-Wind beme_l;_ebus : . .
ﬁ“g gl'l tal water ling” | f d
ultnnalte_ desigh "l“”'d
{63.8-mis)orgreater

Page 29 of 94




FROST PROTECTION

Ry 0 3 € 12 Mies

Figure 1609 (B)

Page 30 of 94



Bay Islands and New Shoreham
included in Coastal offset edge

State of Rhode Island
Wind - Borne Debris Coastal Region Offset

Chapter 17: Special Inspections and Tests

Chapter 17 is adopted with no changes.

Page 31 of 94




1+15-Chapter 18: Soils and Foundations

Chapter 18 is adopted with the following changes. Belete IBC-section1801.3-and
bt hefollow

1809.5 -Delete IBC section 1809.5 Frostproetectionand substitute the following:-

1809.5 Frost Protection

Except where otherwise protected from frost, foundation walls, piers and
other permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected by
one or more of the following methods:

1. SeeRhode-IslandExtending below the frost depth as shown in the
Table-FrostDepth-values below in 8§ 1.4 of this Part;inFable

2. Construction in accordance with ASCE 32; 85or

3. Erecting on solid rock.

Exception: Free-standing buildings meeting all of the following conditions
shall not be required to be protected:

1. Classified in Occupancy Category |, in accordance with section
1604.5;

2. Area of sixtwo hundred (600200) square feet (56-18.58 mM?) or
less-orless-for light-frame-—construction-orfour-hundred (400)
square-feet (37 m?)-orlessfor otherthan-light-frame—construction;
and

3. Eave height of ten feet (10’) (3048 mm) or less.

Footings shall not bear on frozen soil unless such frozen condition is of a
permanent character.

socoproc

Chapter 19: Concrete

Chapter 19 is adopted with no changes.

Page 32 of 94



Chapter 20: Aluminum

Chapter 20 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 21: Masonry

Chapter 21 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 22: Steel

Chapter 22 is adopted with no changes.

1+-17-Chapter 23: Wood

Chapter 23 is adopted with the following changes:

2303.11 Add the following exception to IBC section 2303.1.1 Sawn Lumber

Exception: to 2303.1.1.1

Use of Native Lumber used-shall be in accordance with Rhode Island -Use
of Native Lumber Requlation, Part 18 of this Subchapteramendment
section2310.

Page 33 of 94



Page 34 of 94



Page 35 of 94



Fhickness lnerease—ol | lerease—of
; 1 o 147 147 40 1

L0/

34

105

=

Lo

00

=04

e

0=

L

Page 36 of 94




= 0o

e e =R e =00 =04
e
Mdez2li ) Lo4

Page 37 of 94



Chapter 24: Glass and Glazing

Chapter 24 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 25: Gypsum Board, Gypsum Panel Products and Plaster

Chapter 25 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 26: Plastic

Chapter 26 is adopted with no changes.

1+-18-Chapter 27: Electrical
1181 GENERAL

Pelete-Chapter 27 is deleted and not adopted as part of the Rhode Island Building
Code. allreferences-to-IEC and substitute

Refer to the Rhode Island Electrical Code, SBG-5-2021{Part 5 of this

Subchapter).

Page 38 of 94


https://rules.sos.ri.gov/regulations/part/510-00-00-5

Page 39 of 94



Page 40 of 94



Page 41 of 94



1-19-Chapter 28 Mechanical Systems

Chapter 28 is deleted and not adopted as part of the Rhode Island Building Code.

Refer to the Rhode Island Mechanical Code, Part 4 of this Subchapter, and
Rhode Island Fuel Gas Code, Part 19 of this Subchapter.

~Masonry chimneys, fireplaces
and barbecues shall comply with the Rhode Island Mechanical Code (Part 4 of
this Subchapter) and Chapter 21 of this-IBC 2021, as adopted above in this
Partcode.

Page 42 of 94


https://rules.sos.ri.gov/regulations/part/510-00-00-4

1-20-Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems

Chapter 29 is deleted and not adopted as part of the Rhode Island Building Code.

Refer to the Rhode Island Plumbing Code, Part 3 of this Chapter.

DPelete IBC-section29

121 Chapter 30: Elevatorsand Conveying Systems

Chapter 30 is adopted with the following changes.

3001.1 Delete IBC section 3001.1 Seepe-and substitute the following:

3001.1 SCOPE

Except as may otherwise be provided by statute, the provisions of this
Chapter shall control the design, construction and installation of all special
hoisting and conveying equipment hereafter installed, relocated or altered
in all buildings or structures. The design, construction, installation,
maintenance, relocation and operation of all elevators, dumbwaiters,
moving stairways, moving walks, and certain elevating devices used to
handle materials only, shall be subject to the Rules and Regulations
adopted and enforced by the Rhode Island Department of Labor and
Training, Division of Occupational Safety, Elevator Unit. Portable elevating
devices not covered by this Chapter or by the Department of Labor, shall
be constructed, operated and maintained in compliance with accepted
engineering practice.

Page 43 of 94



122-Chapter 31: Special Construction

Chapter 31 is adopted with no changes.

Page 44 of 94



Page 45 of 94



Chapter 32: Encroachments into the Public Right-of-Way

Chapter 32 is adopted with no changes.

123 Chapter 33: Safeguards During Construction

Chapter 33 is adopted with no changes.

Chapter 34: ReservedExisting-Struetures

Chapter 34 is adopted with no changes.

Page 46 of 94



Page 47 of 94



Page 48 of 94






Page 50 of 94



Page 51 of 94



Page 52 of 94



Page 53 of 94



Page 54 of 94



Page 55 of 94



Page 56 of 94



Page 57 of 94



Page 58 of 94



Page 59 of 94



Page 60 of 94



Page 61 of 94



Page 62 of 94



Page 63 of 94



Page 64 of 94



Page 65 of 94



Page 66 of 94



(AH) - (EEH)
12.5

= CF
(Equation 34-1)

Height value, feet =

Height value, feet = (AS5- EBS) = CF
(Equation 34-2)

Page 67 of 94



Page 68 of 94



Allwakile HAchal HAchml

area e area
Area value { = 1 bt
1, 200squate fret Allcwahle Allowahle
aren ares
! el
{(Equation 34-4)

a
b €
OCGCURPANGY O | Compartment Compartment d
Slzo-af sizo—of Comparn
to-orgreater 10000 2500 size-of 5(
sguarefeet
A~ A3 9 6 10 14
A-2 ] 4 10 14
A4 B E S-2 |0 5 10 15

Page 69 of 94



& b € ¢ e
— 0 0 0 0 1
A2 5 -3 0 1 3
A3A-4BEFEMS-I | 4 -3 0 2 4
R - -2 8 2 4

Page 70 of 94




—=C

Page 71 of 94




Page 72 of 94



.
&
N
b
b
b
b
&

Page 73 of 94



a b € d e
A-LASEFM R S-1 | -10 -5 0 2 6
A-2 -25 -5 0 5 g
A4 B E-S-2 -4 -2 0 4 8
L Colecons o
—hlane

Page 74 of 94




Page 75 of 94



E = o 22 32 32 32 | 42

S 0 28 28 3@ 32 | 3

Page 76 of 94



Page 77 of 94



Page 78 of 94



Page 79 of 94




Maximum allowahle Maxtmum actual
travel distance travel distance

Points = M=
Max. allowable travel distance

(Equation 34-6)

Page 80 of 94



Page 81 of 94




Page 82 of 94



Page 83 of 94



Page 84 of 94




Page 85 of 94




=

-1

=

-1

Page 86 of 94




Smaoka cantrol:
SHHOKE-CORHO+ e

Page 87 of 94




* k k %

* k k %

Page 88 of 94




:
!
!

818 |8 |8 |k 8|8 |8 |V K
818 |8 |8 |k |8 |8 |8 |8 K

Page 89 of 94




FORMULA T3412.7 T3412.8 SCORE | PASS| FAL
FS—MES=0 ES) | - @MES) | =
ME—MME =20 §ME §MME=
GS—MGS =20 §es §M@g:

1-25-Chapter 35: Referenced Standards

Chapter 35 is adopted with the following changes:

FeIBC-Chapter35-aAdd the following General Statement:

The various State of Rhode Island departments and agencies have
designated powers to adopt and enforce Regulations impacting new and

Page 90 of 94




existing construction. Users of this code are advised to use all available
resources to coordinate the design and approval process.

1-26-Appendicesto IBC 2021

Retain-The following Appendices to IBC 2021 are adopted: C, E, F, G, H, and 1.

All other IBC 2021 Appendices are deleted.

1.27—Appendix G_is amended as follows:

FLOOD RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

G105.1 Add the following section to Appendix G105.1-General

1.4 Rhodelsland Snow Load,Wind Speed and Frost Depth Table

G105.1.1 Notice.

Upon receipt of an application for a variance the Chairman-ofthe-Board-of

AppealsState Building Code Commissioner shall forward a copy of said
application to the Rhode Island Emergency Management Office, Attention:
Statewide Flood-Plain Coordinator.

Basic Wind Speed, V (mph)
Municipality [Ground |Flat Roof Risk Risk Risk Risk Cateqo Frost
Snow Snow Cateqory [Category |Category |V Depth
Load Load I gory I gory m qgory \v.
(psf) 1 I 1l
(psf)
From fig |From fig |From fig |From Fig
1609.3(4)|1609.3(1) (1609.3(2)|1609.3(3)
Barrington 30 30 117 127 135 139 4'-0"
Bristol 30 30 118 128 137 (#) 140 (» 4'-0"

Page 91 of 94




Burrillville 40 30 111 121 130 135 4'-0"
Central Falls |30 30 114 124 133 137 4'-0"
Charlestown |30 30 121 131 (#) (140" (143 (M 4'-0"
Coventry 35 30 116 126 135 138 4'-0"
Cranston 30 30 116 126 134 (#) |138 (#) 4'-Q"
Cumberland |40 30 116 123 131 136 4'-0"
East 30 30 118 128 136 (#) |140 (%) 4'-0"
Greenwich

East 30 30 115 126 134 (#) (138 (#) 4'-0"
Providence

Exeter 35 30 118 128 137 140 (%) 4'-0"
Foster 40 30 112 123 131 135 4'-0"
Glocester 40 30 112 122 135 135 4'-0"
Hopkinton |35 30 119 128 137 141 () 4'-Q"
Jamestown |30 30 108 121 131 (#) (139 (#) 4'-0"
Johnston 35 30 114 125 133 137 4'-0"
Lincoln 40 30 113 124 132 136 4'-0"
Little 30 30 121 131 (#) 140 (%) [144 () 4'-0"
Compton

Middletown (30 30 121 131 (#) |(139(#) (143 (» 4'-0"
Narragansett |30 30 121 131 (#) (140(*) (143 (%) 4'-0"

Page 92 of 94




New 25 25 124 134 (#) (143 (*) (149 (*) 2'-6"
Shoreham

Newport 30 30 121 131 (#) 140 (144 (*) 4'-0"

(*)

North 30 30 119 129 138 (#) (141 (») 4'-Q"
Kingstown

North 35 30 114 124 133 137 4'-0"
Providence

North 40 30 112 122 131 135 4'-0"
Smithfield

Pawtucket 35 30 114 125 133 137 4'-Q"
Portsmouth |30 30 120 129 138 (#) 142 (») 4'-0"
Providence |30 30 115 125 134 (#) |138 (#) 4'-0"
Richmond 35 30 119 129 137 141 (*) 4'-0"
Scituate 35 30 114 132 133 137 4'-0"
Smithfield 40 30 113 123 131 136 4'-0"
South 30 30 121 130 (#) (139 (#) (143 () 4'-Q"
Kingstown

Tiverton 30 30 119 129 138 (#) 142 (») 4'-0"
Warren 30 30 114 127 136 (#) 140 (» 4'-0"
\Warwick 30 30 117 127 136 (#) 139 (#) 4'-0"
\West 35 30 117 127 135 139 4'-0"
Greenwich

Page 93 of 94




West 30 30 116 126 135 139 4'-0"
Warwick

Westerly 30 30 120 137 (#) |138.(#) [142 (") 4'-0"
Woonsocket |40 30 112 122 130 135 4'-0"
Notes:

# - Wind-borne Debris Region greater than 130 MPH within a

mile of “mean high coastal water line”

*- Wind-borne Debris Region In areas where wind speed is 140

mph (63.6 m/s) or

greater

Page 94 of 94




